RE: Mr Pettman - Offer of Consultancy and Relat...

Subject: RE: Mr Pettman - Offer of Consultancy and Related Matters.

From: Kelly Tinkler <kelly.tinkler@keystonelaw.co.uk>

Date: 07/06/2018, 12:09

To: "Jason, The JET Group" <jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>

CC: Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>, David Bailey <David.Bailey@healys.com>, "index arb" <indexarb@hotmail.com>, George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>, Stuart
Pettman - Spap <spettman@spap.co.uk>

Dear Jason
| attach an email from David Bailey to Stuart. You will see the first line states:
I am pleased to report that George has confirmed that they will support you in your claim against Harry Daniels.
As you are aware, Stuart (and 1) have acted in reliance upon that.
Can you please now confirm that both David and George were authorised to make that written promise on behalf of the JET Group.
Despite that promise, a number of my invoices remain unpaid, some dating from September last year, and | now need to take steps to protect Stuart’s position.
| look forward to hearing from you as soon as possible.
Regards
Kelly
Best Regards

Kelly Tinkler
Consultant Solicitor

020 3319 3700
0845 458 9398

From: George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>

Sent: 29 May 2018 16:55

To: Stuart Pettman - Spap <spettman@spap.co.uk>

Cec: Jason, The JET Group <jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>; Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>; George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>; Kelly Tinkler
<Kelly.Tinkler@keystonelaw.co.uk>; David Bailey <David.Bailey@healys.com>; index arb <indexarb@hotmail.com>

Subject: Mr Pettman - Offer of Consultancy and Related Matters.

Importance: High

Dear Stuart,

Hope you are well. Please be advised that the a formal offer together with supporting drafted and proposed documentation will be with you by close of play
tomorrow.

Apologies for our semi-informed position at this point, but have indirectly heard various updates and commentary regarding this matter today — please be
sure to highlight by return asap any new or additional factors you want considering such that they can be accommodated where / if possible.

Accordingly, and on a more specific point, I am aware that the idea to make an advanced “good faith” payment (today or tomorrow and of circa £15,000)
was raised recently — pending the finalisation and completion of the above said documentation.

Whilst T understand this remains an option from this side, it is hoped this will not be necessary, given it is anticipated all relevant and final documentation
will be available able to be completed within 24 — 48 hours and thus supersede the purpose.

Moreover, it is feared that such payment would only evoke discord given that it is now understood you hoped to use it specifically to compensate your
lawyer Mr Tinkler, which under normal circumstances would be of no issues and indeed all I suggest would be happy that you are relieving the financial
burden upon yourself, however, for reasons you are aware it is likely not as simple as that as Mr Bailey would arguably and equitably also be due a share of
such sum or the entire sum. Obviously, these are not matters of our concern directly, but given the complexities of relationships and introductions made etc,
the last thing wanted is for you to be in any situation where by no fault of your own, and relating to matters beyond your control, you are under any
additional distress.

THEREFORE, I am advised as stated — documents with you by close of play tomorrow. Funds to follow such that all holistic and cross party matters at
hand can be resolved satisfactorily across the board.

Thanks in advance — hopefully this will finally enable a conclusion to these matters.

Kind Regards
George

Consultant on behalf of RANsquawk.
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Keystone Law is a trading name of Keystone Law Limited, an entity i and by the ion Authority with its registered office at First Floor, 48 Chancery Lane, London WC2A 1JF,
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Subject: RE: Harry Daniels

From: David Bailey <David.Bailey@healys.com>

Date: 07/09/2017, 11:12

To: Stuart Pettman <stuartpettman@googlemail.com>, "heatherpettman@gmail.com" <heatherpettman@gmail.com>
CC: Kelly Tinkler <kelly.tinkler@keystonelaw.co.uk>

Hi Stuart and Heather

| am pleased to report that George has confirmed that they will support you in your claim against Harry Daniels.

Further to our telephone conversation as | explained | have enlisted the assistance of a former partner of mine Kelly Tinkler at Keystone Law

LeglWeck
e UK 200

COMPANIES TO INSPIRE NV

BRITAIN:

(http://www.keystonelaw.co.uk/lawyers/kelly-tinkler) to represent you. Kelly has confirmed that he is conflict free. | attach a retainer letter for Kelly and shall be
grateful if you will consider it carefully and if you have any queries please let me know. If you are happy with it please sign the letter and return it to me (a scanned

signature page will do).
| have forwarded your copy passport and ID document to Kelly for his own AML checks.
As explained we will now start drafting your affidavits for your approval in the near future.
In the meantime please could you let me have in relation to your home:-
1. Latest annual mortgage statement from Barclays in respect of the first charge.
2. Statement from Paul Mullan as to the amount outstanding under his Final Charging Orders.
3. Once you receive it an up to date redemption statement from both Barclays and Paul Mullan.
If you have any queries please do call me.
Kind regards
David Bailey

Partner
Commercial Litigation

Atrium Court
DirectDial: ~ +44 - (0)1273-810 064 15-17 Jockey's Fields
Mobile: +44 - (0)7887 - 700 205 London
Fax: +44 - (0)1273 - 685 454 ~WC1R4QR
Switchboard:  +44 - (0)1273 - 685 888 United Kingdom
DX: 1021 London Chancery Lane
Email: David.Bailey@healys.com
Website: www.healys.com
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IMPORTANT NOTICE - CYBERCRIME ALERT.

(1) In light of the increased risk posed by cyber fraud and especially those resulting to bank account details, please take extra caution and always be vigilant in relation to
electronic transfer of funds. Please exercise caution when opening any emails, attachments or links and when responding to any requests for your bank details or notices of
changes to bank details of others. Our policy in respect of any change of this firm’s bank details (which will be extremely rare) are set out in our retainer letter to you. We will
NOT accept responsibility if you transfer money into an incorrect bank account. Our general policy is NOT to accept any changes to bank account details provided by email.

(2) Healys accept no responsibility for emails which purport to be sent by us. It is your responsibility to ensure that the email is genuine before relying upon anything
contained within it. Please also refer to our cyber crime warning on the firm’s website.

Authorised and Regulated by the Solicitors Regulation Authority. A list of the members of the LLP and of non-members who are described as partners is available for
inspection at Atrium Court, 15-17 Jockey's Fields, London, WC1R 4QR. "Healys" and "Healys Solicitors" are trading names of Healys LLP which is a Limited Liability
Partnership. Registration number OC342610. We use the word 'partner’ to refer to a member of the LLP or an employee, or non member partner, or consultant with equivalent
standing and qualifications. The content of this e-mail (and any attachment) |s confldentlal The information transmitted is intended only for use by the addressee and may
contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, re-transmi: 1ation or other use of it, or the taking of any action in reliance upon this information by
persons and/or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, please inform the sender and/or addressee immediately and
delete the e-mail and any attachments. Thank you for your co-operation. Healys uses virus checking software and we are not aware that this communication contains any
viruses. However, we cannot guarantee that no viruses are present and we accept no liability for any damage caused by you opening this communication or any attachments
or hyperlinks contained in it. Click here: www.healys.com/site/people/ for a list of partners and places of busi We are subject to the Solicitors' Code of Conduct, a copy of
which can be found here: www.sra.org.uk/rules/ We do not accept service by e-mail.
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ForwardedMessage.eml 1.7 MB
Mr and Mrs Heather and Stuart .pdf 637 KB
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