Re: 0% Interest Free Loan to Mr Pettman. Please...
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Subject: Re: 0% Interest Free Loan to Mr Pettman. Please approve and transaction transfer asap.

From: Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>

Date: 19/06/2018, 19:28

To: George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>

CC: Stuart Pettman <stuartpettman@gmail.com>, Pierce Dimmick <pd@pjmarksandco.com>, Aubrey Hayward
<aubrey.hayward@ransquawk.com>, "Adam Linton" <adam.linton@aragonfinancial.co.uk>, index arb
<indexarb@hotmail.com>, "Jason, The JET Group" <jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>, Albie Turner
<ast@pjmarksandco.com>

Agreed

On 19 Jun 2018, at 17:49, George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>
wrote:

Dear All,

Given Adam Linton is on Holiday and ideally this needs his approval | will approve it online and in the
event he does not authorise then | hereby take personal liability for the amount as | am aware Stuart
would be grateful and benefit from this loan today.

If no objectives then please advise, otherwise | will approve now at the bank.

G

From: Stuart Pettman <stuartpettman@gmail.com>

Sent: 19 June 2018 17:31

To: Pierce Dimmick <pd @pjmarksandco.com>

Cc: George Eaton-Busfield <george @g-cv.com>; Aubrey Hayward <aubrey.hayward @ransquawk.com>;
Adam Linton <adam.linton@aragonfinancial.co.uk>; index arb <indexarb@hotmail.com>; Jason, The
JET Group <jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>; Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>; Albie Turner
<ast@pjmarksandco.com>

Subject: Re: 0% Interest Free Loan to Mr Pettman. Please approve and transaction transfer asap.

Dear Pierce

My details are correct.
Regards

Stuart Pettman

Sent from my iPhone

On 19 Jun 2018, at 17:17, Pierce Dimmick <pd @pjmarksandco.com> wrote:

Hi George/all,

| have raised the payment from the RAN account so if you could check the details on the
payment before you confirm and get Adam L's approval.

From
Account Name

REALTIME ANALYSIS AND NEWS LTD

Account Number

24725596

Sort Code
230580

27/10/2018, 22:33



Re: 0% Interest Free Loan to Mr Pettman. Please...

To
Account Name

Mr S Pettman

Account Number
23906295

Sort Code
230580

Payment Amount£7,500.00

CurrencyGBP

Metrobank ReferenceS Pettman Loan
Payment Datel9 JUN 2018

Metrobank Payment ReferenceFT18170KYPQ)

Thanks,

Name: Pierce Dimmick

Address: RANsquawk, 115B Drysdale Street, Hoxton London N1 6ND
Tel: +44 (0)20 7033 8640

Fax: +44 (0)20 7377 9837

Email: billings@accounts.ransquawk.com

From: George Eaton-Busfield [mailto:george @g-cv.com]

Sent: 19 June 2018 17:04

To: Aubrey Hayward <aubrey.hayward @ransquawk.com>; Adam Linton
<adam.linton@aragonfinancial.co.uk>; Pierce Dimmick <pd @pjmarksandco.com>

Cc: index arb <indexarb@hotmail.com>; Jason, The JET Group
<jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>; Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>; George Eaton-Busfield
<george@g-cv.com>; Albie Turner <ast@pjmarksandco.com>; Stuart Pettman
<stuartpettman@gmail.com>

Subject: 0% Interest Free Loan to Mr Pettman. Please approve and transaction transfer
asap.

Importance: High

Hi Aubrey, Pierce, Adam L,

Please can you raise a £7500 payment from RAN Metro Account to Stuart Pettman
Personal Account (Please check with Stuart but | think it comes up as “Mrs Pettman” for
some reason - but please do double check the account as it is to Stuart Personally and
not his company.

Subject to Aubrey, Adam Linton, Jason, Adam Voce approval Stuart has agreed for this
loan to made to him and a rate of 0% and repayable with 48 months.

It is intended and hoped that this will enable him to purchase IT equipment and / or
address other concerns he has in order that he can provide and assist RANSQUAWK with
the best of his abilities.

Stuart and myself have agreed it within his contract also.

Please kindly approve and raise this asap (and advise if you need me to do anything else)
as | understand it would be helpful to Stuart if this was processed today.

Please all advise if anything you | have stated inaccurately or should otherwise consider.

Otherwise thanks in advance and please expedite.
G
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Re: 0% Interest Free Loan to Mr Pettman. Please...

Ps. | will now continue to try and finalise the numbers for Stuart and for the VAT elements
and interaction with RAN Limited, JET / JETS so as to optimise accounting matters.
thx
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