
Subject: HMRC DUE TODAY
From: "Jason Earl, JET" <jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>
Date: 07/06/2019, 14:24
To: Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>
CC: Aubrey Hayward <aubrey.hayward@ransquawk.com>, Anthony Cheung <anthonywmcheung@gmail.com>,
RAN Billings <billings@accounts.ransquawk.com>, George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>, Cindy Busfield
<fieldhouse@ntlworld.com>, Chandrakant Patel <chandrakantpatel51@outlook.com>, Albie Turner
<albie@versaaccountants.co.uk>, Neil Cameron <neil@versaaccountants.co.uk>, Jamie McGilvray ACIB
<jamie@versaaccountants.co.uk>, "Matthew Cheung (Personal)" <matthewcheung50@hotmail.com>, Nicola-Robin
<nicolarobinbusfield@hotmail.com>, Jamie / James Voce <jamesv@earnestadv.com>

All,

Following yesterdays self-approved payment to GCV I have come to find yet another self
approved payment to GCV for £8588.79.

I can not stress how important it is that we have a payment of £8836.63 due today to
HMRC. This payment can not be delayed and if not met the full outstanding balance
(which is circa £40K from what I recall) becomes immediately due.

Adam, seeing as you and Versa made this agreement with HMRC, what are you do doing
to ensure this is met by the close of business today?

Following this we also have a payment to Wework due immanently of just over £13K.

It should be noted that we would have been in a position to make these payments
yesterday if it wasn't for the fact George had self authorized these payments to him self.
Again, Adam, what are you doing to address this? You have failed to answer my question
regarding if you approved this payment or George (using your bank login). Further to this,
the GCV payment has your name on it which makes you responsible and liable.

If this HMRC payment is not addressed by the end of the day, I personally will be reaching
out to HMRC first thing on Monday morning to explain why these obligations were not
met. I'm sure HMRC will have probing questions as to why GCV has received this money
when it has not had prior approval, and no invoices have been sent.

George, would care to explain this? You have previously claimed this has been for the
accounts which you have not done and later has been picked up by Versa. I am well aware
you should not be working and it angers me this is getting raised when we have people
working long hours on the desk who are on a fraction of what you are taking out who
actually contributing to the day to day running of the business.

If this is not for work, then given there is no invoice there is it effectively theft. As I am
already scheduled to go to the police station to provide a witness statement (for a totally
unrelated matter tied to my previous housemates), I will raising this matter with them as
this has gone on for far too long and I have duty to report crime.

I have CC'ed shareholders because I believe they need to be aware of such actions, as in
previous situations under RAN such matters were stifled.

Regards,
Jase

On 06/06/2019 15:29, Jason Earl, JET group wrote:

Approved as always Alec. Thanks.
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Hopefully we can raise this soon. I'm concerned that you might be paid late because I
note that Mr Busfield seems to have paid himself £6900 into GCV just now not leaving
enough money for you.

I'm concerned because unlike you, he seems to conveniently forget to send invoices
(despite me highlighting this fact on several occasions). Another thing comes to mind
which is that GCV seems to get significantly more than £85K a year, but I'm not aware
of it being VAT registered. Obviously Versa will know one way or another what the
answer is here.

I'm a little curious as to what this £6900 is for? Maybe Mr Busfield would like the
entertain us with a breakdown of what services he's provided from in May 2018? One
thing for sure, it won't be as detailed as the spreadsheet you and Versa have provided
that's for sure.

If cash flow is an issue for you Alec, I'll do my best to lend some cash, as I'm well aware
your invoices go in a week later than everyone else and is unfair and wrong that you
have to then wait longer only for this to happen.

Regards,
Jase

On 06/06/2019 13:13, Alec Baughan wrote:

Hi Jase,

Please find a�ached my invoice 2222 for May.  Below are excerpts of the report providing the figures reflected in
the invoice.

Triscar revenue:

Alec revenue:

JLD revenue:

FTS revenue:
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The following shows April adjustments (due to pos�ng payments into Sage a�er last month’s commission report
was produced):

Original April Triscar revenue:

Updated April Triscar revenue:

April Triscar revenue adjustment = 8,500.14 – 7,620.14 = 880.00

Original April Alec revenue:

Updated April Alec revenue:

April Alec revenue adjustment = 14,749.27 – 13,599.27 = 1,150.00

Original April JLD revenue:

Updated April JLD revenue:

April JLD revenue adjustment = 612.92 – 446.50 = 166.42

Original April FTS revenue:

Updated April FTS revenue:

April FTS revenue adjustment = 311.00 – 311.00 = 0.00
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If you’d kindly approve this invoice for Pierce to raise for payment that would be very much appreciated.

Many thanks,

Alec.
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