
From: Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>
Sent: 26 April 2019 09:27
To: Alec Baughan <alec.baughan@ransquawk.com>
Subject: Re: Debtors - Centrica Plc

Ok Alec no need to call thanks for the update.

On 26 Apr 2019, at 09:23, Alec Baughan <alec.baughan@ransquawk.com> wrote:

Hi mate,

I can call you about it if you like, but the situation is that they
had a drop in users. They have been paying for up to 10 users on the
desk (but never had more than 7) and we've spent the last few months

renegotiating.

That finalised this last week, and we're changing from 15k for up to
10 users, to 10.2k for the five remaining on the desk. Invoice will
be changed at the next bill run at the end of the month and they'll pay

soon after.

Thanks,

Alec.

-----Original Message-----
From: Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>
Sent: 26 April 2019 08:15
To: Alec Baughan <alec.baughan@ransquawk.com>
Subject: Debtors - Centrica Plc

Good Morning Alec,

Hope you are well.

I have just noticed Centrica Plc on the debtors list. I wouldn't
usually bother you with individual debtors but the amount is eye
catching! When you get time today could you please give me a call to

discuss thanks.

Regards
Adam
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