
Subject: FW: Payment pending on Lloyds Link
From: George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>
Date: 14/09/2016, 12:00
To: RAN Billings <billings@accounts.ransquawk.com>
CC: Albie Turner <ast@pjmarksandco.com>, Michael Wearn <mw@pjmarksandco.com>,
George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>, "jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk"
<jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>

Hi Kisha,
These need to be paid by JET now NOT RAN Ltd.  -Please speak to Albie or Michael as they will have the
payment details.

They need to be authorised by me and Jason.

Please confirm you understand and will pass for payment by JET now… thanks
George

From: RAN Billings [mailto:billings@accounts.ransquawk.com]
Sent: 14 September 2016 10:23
To: George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>
Cc: Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>
Subject: Payment pending on Lloyds Link

Hi George,

Following payment pending on Lloyds for approval

· GOOGLE INV3360076024 for £ 310.99 – Value date 09/09/2016

Kind Regards,
Kisha

1 of 1

Jason

Jason

Jason


