
Subject: RE: Re: Legal Invoice
From: RAN Billings <billings@accounts.ransquawk.com>
Date: 25/08/2017, 16:20
To: "Jason, The JET Group" <jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>

Is this via Jet?

From: Jason, The JET Group [mailto:jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk]
Sent: 25 August 2017 16:18
To: Pierce Dimmick <pd@pjmarksandco.com>
Subject: Fwd: Re: Legal Invoice

FYI

-------- Forwarded Message --------
Subject:Re: Legal Invoice

Date:Fri, 25 Aug 2017 16:01:09 +0100
From:Jason, The JET Group <jason.earl@thejetgroup.co.uk>

To:Adam Voce <adam@g-cv.com>
CC:George Eaton-Busfield <george@g-cv.com>

Hi PJM,

Can you please raise £25000 to David Bailey as agreed by me and Adam 

Regards,

Jase

On 25/08/17 15:47, Adam Voce wrote:

Hi Jase,

Please see attached original invoice from Healys to settle, £6,580.40 has already been
transferred as an interim payment so that would leave £25,000.

If you are happy to do so as per Georges original email could you please raise this for
payment.

Kind Regards
Adam
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